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Baldwin, Benjamin
<

From: Murphy, Michael (Alderman)

Sent: Wednesday, September 09, 2020 1:23 PM

To: Baldwin, Benjamin

Subject: Re: Denial Letter- Maria Hammercadb01270199.1
Benjamin,

Sorry to bother you on this again. Would you actually be able to mail the letter to Maria? | forgot that she
needs to take a picture of the postmarked envelope to send an appeal.

Thank you!

Jenn Byrne

Legislative Aide, Alderman Murphy 10th District

200 East Wells Street — 2™ Floor | Milwaukee, WI 53202
414.286.2074

jennifer.byrne@milwaukee.gov

From: Baldwin, Benjamin <bmbaldw@milwaukee.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, September 8, 2020 10:48 AM

To: Murphy, Michael (Alderman) <mmurph@milwaukee.gov>
Subject: RE: Denial Letter- Maria Hammercadb01270199.1

Teamwork at its finest—have a wonderful day!!!

Benjamin

From: Murphy, Michael (Alderman)

Sent: Tuesday, September 08, 2020 10:37 AM

To: Baldwin, Benjamin

Subject: Re: Denial Letter- Maria Hammercadb01270199.1

Thank you for clarifying this. No need to mail again, | will reach out to Ms. Hammerer.

Sincerely,

Michael J. Murphy

Alderman, 10t District

200 East Wells Street — 2nd Floot | Milwaukee, WI 53202
414.286.3763

mmutph@milwaukee.gov

From: Baldwin, Benjamin <bmbaldw@milwaukee.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, September 8, 2020 10:13 AM




To: Murphy, Michael (Alderman) <mmurph@milwaukee.gov>
Subject: Denial Letter- Maria Hammercadb01270199.1

Alderman:
Should | remail this letter? Your thoughts.
Benjamin

Benjamin M Baldwin

Investigation / Adjuster.

Office of the Milwaukee City Attorney
841 North Broadway, Suite 716
Milwaukee, W| 53202

General Office: 414-286-2601

Direct Dial: 414-286-5032

Fax: 414-286-8550

Email: bmbaldw@milwaukee.gov
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COMFORT STAR

3710 W ROCHELLE AVE
MILWAUKEE, WI 53209 US
(414) 759-0095
hvacstar@att.net
www.comfortstarhvac.com

MARIA HAMMERER
416 SOUTH 60TH
MILWAUKEE, WI 53214

2753 01/02/2020 $3,296.00

WEATHER KING F 92 70BTU 3T

WEATHER KING W92T SERIES GAS FURNACE -
92% EFFICIANT, SINGLE STAGE, ECM
CONSTANT TORQUE, 70000 BTU 3 TON,
DIRECT SPARK IGNITION - MODEL #
W92PA0701317MSA. . INCLUDES INSTALLATION
AND REMOVAL OF EXISTING FURNACE.

RETURN DROP
RETURN DROP 16 X 25 FILTER TRAY INCLUDES

INSTALLATION '

DISCLOSURE

MARIA HAMMERER'S RELATIONSHIP TO THE
ABOVE PROPERTY ADDRESS WHERE WORK 1S
BEING COMPLETED IS (OWNER) .

PAYMENT OF $850.00 TO COMMENCE WORK
AS DESCRIBED ABOVE. MINIMUM MONTHLY
PAYMENTS OF $150.00 ON THE 1ST OF EACH
MONTH STARTING FEBUARY 1ST, 2020. LIEN
WILL BE APPLIED TO PROPERTY ADDRESS
ABOVE FOR ANY UNPAID BALANCE AFTER 30
DAYS, WHEN BALANCE IS PAID INFULL
CUSTOMER WILL RECIEVE LIEN WAIVER.
INTEREST WILL BE APPLIED AT 2% EACH
MONTH IF MINIMUM PAYMENT IS NOT MADE ON
THE 1ST EACH MONTH ON ANY REMAINING
BALANCE.

| HAVE THE
AUTHORITY TO ORDER THE ABOVE WORK &
DO SO ORDER AS OUTLINED ABOVE. DRIVERS
LICENCE #

CUSTOMER SIGNATURE

mowe  Comfort St

HEATING & COOLING

MARIA HAMMERER
416 SOUTH 60TH
MILWAUKEE, WI 53214

02/01/2020 Net 30
1 2,986.00 2,986.00
1 310.00 310.00
1 0.00 0.00



Lien Notice. AS REQUIRED BY THE WISCONSIN CONSTRUCTION LIEN BALANCE DUE
LAW, CONTRACTOR HEREBY NOTIFIES OWNER THAT PERSONS OR
COMPANIES FURNISHING LABOR OR MATERIALS FOR THE
CONSTRUCTION ON OWNER'S LAND MAY HAVE LIEN RIGHTS ON
OWNER'S LAND AND BUILDINGS IF NOT PAID, THOSE ENTITLED TO
LIEN RIGHTS, IN ADDITION TO THE UNDERSIGNED CONTRACTOR, ARE
THOSE WHO CONTRACT DIRECTLY WITH THE OWNER OR THOSE WHO
GIVE THE BUYER NOTICE WITHIN FIVE (5) DAYS AFTER THEY FIRST
FURNISH LABOR OR MATERIALS FOR THE CONSTRUCTION.
ACCORDINGLY, OWNER WILL PROBABLY RECGEIVE NOTIGE FROM
THOSE WHO FURNISH LABOR OR MATERIALS FOR THE
CONSTRUGTION AND SHOULD GIVE A COPY OF EACH NOTICE
RECEIVED TO HIS MORTGAGE LENDER, IF ANY. GONTRACTOR
AGREES TO COOPERATE WITH THE OWNER AND HIS LENDER, IF ANY,
TO SEE THAT ALL POTENTIAL LIEN GLAIMANTS ARE DULY PAID.

$3,296.00



Residence Ny,

BY MARRIOTT

Residence Inn® Milwaukee West
1300 Discovery Parkway, Wauwatosa, Wl 53226 P 414.258.2575
Marriott.com/MKEWE

Maria Hammerer

Room: 424

1 Wllinois St Room Type: ONBR
St Charles iL 60174 Number of Guests: 1
Ale Solutions Rate: $79.00 Clerk; NTE
Arrive: 01Jan20 Time: 09:35AM Depart: 02Jan20 Time: 10:11AM Folio Number: 51534
DATE DESCRIPTION CHARGES CREDITS
01Jan20 Room Charge 79.00
01Jan20 Gity Tax 553
01Jan20 State Sales Tax 395
01Jan20 Occupancy Tax 1.08
01Jan20 Convention and Tourism Tax 0.08
01Jan20 County Tax 0.40
02Jan20 Visa 90.94

Card # VIXOXXXXXXXXXX33TE/XXXX
Amount:  90.94 Auth: 002366 Signature on File
This card was elzctronicafly swiped on 01Jan20

BALANCE: 0.00

As a Marriott Bonvoy Member, you could have earned points towards your free dream vacation today. Start earning points and Elite status,

plus enjoy exclusive member offers. Enroll today at the front desk.

See our "Privacy & Cookie Statement" on Marriott.com.

Operated under license from Marriott International, Inc. or one of its affiliates.

To plan your next stay, visit Residencelnn.com.



