26 November 2019
To: City of Milwaukee
From: Kristopher Kier LY SRR OFFICE
Subj: Claim for 1433 E. Pryor Ave.

Claim# 1068-2019-1927

s
l'am writing to réquest a hearing to appeal the denial of m“y claim. The letter | received from the city has
incorrect information in it and | would like to make it clear what happened. The city workers damaged
my railing and pulled it out of the ground when they winched the tree. They did not move it prior that is
false. | stood there and watched them do it and so did several of my neighbors.

/_\

Kristopher Kier

RECEIVED
OFFICE OF CITY ATTORNEY

DEC 6- 2018
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To: City of Milwaukee
From: CDR Kristopher Kier, Commanding Officer Naval Support Center Milwaukee

Subject: Property damage to 1433 E Pryor Ave.

On 25 June 2018 our neighbors 1427 E Pryor Ave tree that was planted by the forestry
department fell onto our property and landed in our yard and over our railing. The city of Milwaukee
tree removal team showed up to remove the tree. | pointed out that the tree would need to cut before
winching it into the wood chipper to prevent damage to the railing. The tree crew did not cut the tree
prior and winched the tree, which hulled out our railing. The lead on the team gave me the form to
submit the claim to the city.

We contracted Storybook Forge to replace the railing and they completed the railing on 20 September
2019. We paid them $1,585.00 and requesting to be reimbursed for the total cost of $1585.00

Please see enclosed invoice for $1,585.00 and Incident report.
Please feel free to contact me with any further questions.

757-373-5688

Kristopher.kier@gmail.com
/ ' RECEIVED
OFFICE OF CITY ATTORNEY

CDR Kristopher Kier SEP 27 2019
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St@@bwk Forge and Metal Works, LLC

Custom Ornamental Railings, Staifs, Gates, Fences, Furniture, B%@ksinithin g

3635 E. Mallory Ave. Cudahy, 53110
414—48%-1610
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Payment due within 30 days, unless otherwise arranged.



