Baldwin, Benjamin

From: Willie Jackson <tarressawj76@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, October 24, 2018 2:47 PM
To: Baldwin, Benjamin

Subject: Re: 317015.pdf

I will like to request a hearing on this matter.

On Tue, Oct 23, 2018, 11:30 AM Baldwin, Benjamin <bmbaldw(@milwaukee.gov> wrote:

As requested

Benjamin M Baldwin

Investigation / Adjuster.

Office of the Milwaukee City Attorney |
841 North Broadway, Suite 716
Milwaukee, WT 53202

General Office: 414-286-2601

Direct Dial: 414-286-5032 /
f;ﬁ £ Z /
Fax: 414-286-8550 X M ¥ S
-~ i ,gc {,f
Email: bmbaldw(@milwaukee.gov ¢ /j; i d 5
- e i W
z 0 [y
W ¢ ( Iy
: > £
V% J

9,
The City of Milwaukee is subject to Wisconsin Statutes related to public records. Unless other@%/ ise gxempd
from the public records law, senders and receivers of City of Milwaukee e-mail should presume that e-mail i
subject to release upon request, and is subject to state records retention requirements. See City of Mﬂwa e .
full e-mail disclaimer at www.milwaukee.gov/email disclaimer o
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ATTN: Claims

200 E. Wells St., Rm 205 ﬁuﬁi@m

Milwaukee, WI 53202-3567

To Whom It May Concern:

My name is Willie Jackson. On May 18, 2018 | was visiting Milwaukee attending my nephew graudation
at The Milwaukee Theatre at 500 W Kilbourn Ave. Between 4:15 - 4:30 | was crossing the street on 4
and Kilbourn and my feet went into the broken concrete and | fell hurt both of my knees. The right knee
was cut badly and the left knee was bust open ana | had to receive 8 stitches from the fall. There was a
car.accident on the same street. When | fell the police officer came to make sure | was ok and asked did |
need any help; I told him I didn't because at the time | didn' feel | need any medical help at the time. As
| went into the building | checked my leg due to my pants feeling wet and that is when | noticed that it
was cut open and bleeding very bad. At this point | had to let my family know | had to leave because | have
to go to the ER because of my leg. | would have been filed my claims but I have not received by bill from
Froedtert Hospital have not came yet.

I came up there from Arkansas to attend my nephew graduation and to attend his after event with the
family but | could not go due to the bleeding and pain and having to go to the ER to get stitches. | would
like to put a claim in for $15000

I can be reached at 8702091427 if you have any question or | can be contacted at the above address,

I am attaching some pictures of my knee. There will be pictures of how it looked open, with stitches, and
after the stitches were removed

Thank you,

Willie Jackson
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