Rodriguez, Charlotte

S |
From: Candace Washington <candacewashington46@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, August 08, 2016 4:40 PM
To: Rodriguez, Charlotte
Subject: Re: Money Reimbursement For Ride

I Candace Washington would like to appeal my claim if you have any questions please feel free to call me at
414 544 1744

On Jul 13,2016 12:45 PM, "Candace Washington" <candacewashington46@gmail.com> wrote:

I'will also be seeking to get the money that I am paying out for people to take me places like to paying my rent,
doctor's appointments, and ect. So far I have paid almost a $110 due to not being able to drive my car if you
have any questions or concerns please feel free to contact me at 414-544-1744

Thanks

Candace Washington

On Jul 11, 2016 11:34 AM, "Candace Washington" <candacewashington46@gmail.com> wrote:
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Milwaukee, W1 53202-3567

To Whom It May Concern my name

is Candace Washington on June 21, 2016:

I was driving (with my son, and his father in the car) down Custer coming around to hopkins behind
one of the city trucks near Aldi's when notice something fell off the back of the truck I tried to avoid
hitting but I still manage to hit it anyway so I pulled over into a gas station to make a phone call to my
son's uncle who's a mechanic to tell him what had happened and he ask me was the car still drivable
and if so try to get to the shop so he could look at it | told him | would try and see but as | started
driving 1 could hear something dragging underneath the car so | pulled over again and seen my front
bumper was hanging and a big nail was hanging from my car | removed it and | continue to head to
the shop but when | got there and he was working on a car so he told me to come back tomorrow
(06/21/16) so | went back home | never notice my car was over heating until the next day when | was
on my way back to the shop the next day so | turned around and started to he home but the car got to
hot so | pulled over to go find some water I pull a little change in the parking meter the little that | had
and | went looking for water and when I returned | had a ticket for $22 all | am asking is for my car to
be repaired..... | Am asking for $2000 for Bumper I'll get prices, Radiator Replace ( for labor and new
radiator is $ 440) Moe's Automotive, Ticket ($28), and the tow to get my car to the shop....

Sincerely, Candace Washington

P.S If you have any question or concerns ,\6/
ss1o N 62"

please feel free to call me at 414-544-1744
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From: Candace Washington <candacewashington46@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, July 11, 2016 11:21 AM
To: Rodriguez, Charlotte
Subject: Re: claim RECEIWVED
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On Mon, Jul 11, 2016 at 11:00 AM, Candace Washington <candacewashington46@gmail.com> wrote:
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On Mon, Jul 11, 2016 at 10:51 AM, Candace Washington <candacewashington46@gmail.com> wrote:



Rodriguez, Charlotte

From: Candace Washington <candacewashington46@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, July 11, 2016 11:34 AM

To: Rodriguez, Charlotte

Subject: Ticket

Attachments: 20160711 _103216.jpg
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Rodriguez, Charlotte

From:

Sent:

To:

Subject:
Attachments:

$30.00

Candace Washington <candacewashington46@gmail.com>
Monday, July 11, 2016 11:35 AM
Rodriguez, Charlotte

Paid tickets
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Thank you. The paymeni will be posted to your account within 1 business day.
Please keep a copy ofthis receipt for your records. :

OTMA72016 11:32:17 AM

Yourpaym’emreferencenumi:erisr4721ﬁﬂ?1r12@3378 B

s note thattha charge for this payment will appaar on your credit card statement as
(CITY OF MILW PARKING WEB'. il s o
payment Lo make itinte our sysiem. Please do not pay more than once.

payment Amount:

ingten

Cardholder Mame:

Crzdit Card Number: KUK XXX XO205




