2/21/25, 12:40 AM Aséension Mall - [EXTERNAL] Re: Letter/claims dept.

& Ascension Bliecs, . . Tt e S GihorgS
[EXTERNAL] Re: Letter/claims dept.
1 message
Brittney Hudson <bhud$on2323@nmnil rom>s Thu, Feb 20, 2025 at 11:48 PM

To: Brittney Hudson

On Thu, Feb 20, 2025 at 11:41 PM Brittney Hudson <bhudson2323@gmail.com> wrote:

On Thu, Feb 20, 2025 at 11:28 PM Brittney Hudson <bhudson2323@gmail.com> wrote:
+ To whom may concern:

My name is Brittney Hudson address 4334 N 64th Sirest Milwaukee, W1 53216. On Sunday February 16, 2028 late
evening the city of Milwaukee was notified of an unknown water flood near the Main Street of North 64th between

. Marion and Congress Street . Approximately 12am on February 17, 2025 | received a knock at my front door asking
| residents to please move all vehicles due to water main break located in frant of my house. Hired contractors

' proceeded to locate the main floading source and began to work on repairing the issue. It took approximately six hrs
to complete the task, during the repair unfortunately | was unable to sleep due to the loudness and machines used.

' Around 6am | noticed city workers had left the area but a mixture of Ice, water, mud , and snow was covered
throughout my front walkway and sidewalik. | proceeded to place large amount of sait down to insure the safety of

- myself and others. The area was very slippery due to weather conditions and water mix. After returning back into my

. home | tried to continue my normal morning routine before work by taking a hot shower when | noticed my
shower/tub water pressure was extremely low,

| reached out to the city main line (414)-286-2489 February 17, 2025 to try and troubleshoot the issue but was
unsuccessful. | was advised to reach out to a professional plumber/contractor to investigate the problem. | reached

- out to 2 different professional piumber’s both found debris/ concrete particles possibly from repairs from the water
main shut off. I'm asking the city to PLEASE reimburse me for unexpected repairs. Total cost $494.11

Thank you in advance,

Brittney Hudson
(414) 322-2748

Pt [k

2/20/2025

]

e
.

B ERNDUIN

~
::

1
X

13

LI € d 82831 6m
IRNVRHIN 40 AL

301440

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=1ea7d7 1ae5&view=pt&search=ali&permthid=thread-f; 182464360037 7237904 &simpl=msg-f:1824644814333255990  1/1


Mvh.org
mailto:bhudson2323@gmail.com
mailto:bhudson2323@gmail.com
ttps.7/mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?il%253C=1ea7d71ae5&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1824643600377237904&sjmpl=msg-f:1824644914333255990










