

LAW OFFICES OF
DAVID L. BOROWSKI

COPY

731 N. JACKSON ST. SUITE 824
MILWAUKEE, WI 53202
(414) 276-8950
FAX (414) 276-8953

INVOICE

CLIENT: City of Milwaukee
MATTER: U & L Hearing - Rooming House at 2537 N. Farwell Ave.

DATE	SERVICE	HOURS
5/28/02	Review Chapter 275 of Milw. Code, and review of entire file	1.0
5/29/02	Conduct Hearing at City Hall	2.0
6/5/02	Review Transcript of Hearing, and exhibits	1.0
6/6/02	Draft Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law	3.0
6/7/02	Revise Findings of Fact, proof same	1.0
6/11/02	Finalize Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law, phone conference w/ City Clerk's Office	1.0
6/14/02	Testify before U&L Committee	.5

TOTAL HOURS 9.5

TOTAL DUE = \$1,045.00

** RATE = \$110.00/hr

LAW OFFICES OF

DAVID L. BOROWSKI

COPY

731 N. JACKSON ST. SUITE 824
MILWAUKEE, WI 53202

(414) 276-8950
FAX (414) 276-8953

INVOICE

CLIENT: City of Milwaukee

MATTER: U & L Hearing - Rooming House at 736 S. 3rd Street

DATE	SERVICE	HOURS
6/1/02	Review 'Complaint' and entire file	.5
6/3/02	Conduct Hearing at City Hall	2.0
6/7/02	Review Transcript of Hearing & exhibits	1.0
6/8/02	Draft Findings of Fact & Conclusions of Law	3.0
6/10/02	Proof and revise Findings of Fact and the Conclusions of Law	1.0
6/11/02	Finalize Findings of Fact	.5
6/14/02	Testify before U&L Committee	.5

TOTAL HOURS 8.5

TOTAL DUE = \$935.00

** RATE = \$110.00/hr

COPY

LAW OFFICES OF
DAVID L. BOROWSKI

731 N. JACKSON ST. SUITE 824
MILWAUKEE, WI 53202

(414) 276-8950
FAX (414) 276-8953

INVOICE

CLIENT: City of Milwaukee
MATTER: U & L Hearing - Rooming House at 902 S. 3rd Street

DATE	SERVICE	HOURS
6/1/02	Review file and all 'Complaints', review Chapter 275 of Milw. Code of Ordinances	1.0
6/3/02	Conduct Hearing at City Hall	2.2
6/7/02	Review Transcript of Hearing and exhibits, phone conference w/City Clerk	1.0
6/8/02	Draft Findings of Fact & Conclusions of Law	3.0
6/10/02	Proof and revise Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law	1.0
6/11/02	Finalize Findings of Fact	.5
6/13/02	Prepare for testimony before the U&L Committee of the Common Council	.5
6/14/02	Testify before U&L Committee	.5

TOTAL HOURS = 9.7

TOTAL DUE = \$1,067.00

** RATE = \$110.00/hr.