Annette M. Williams

Cit)‘ of Milwankee

Office of the City Attorney
Mihwaukee City Hall Ste 800
200 East Welis Sireet
Milwaukee, Wisconsin 53202

June 38, 2023

RE:  Subrogation Appeal en behalf of Teresa/ Matthew Hreitrick
C.1. File No:. 1032-2023-258
COur Chim Number: 02006234
Date of occurrence: 08/ 24/2022
Staunory date: 12/22/2022

Dear Cit}: Attrney:

Meemie Insurance received your letter informing us of that the statutory 120 day imeframe wasn’t met therefore barring recovery to Meemic and/or their insured,
Teresa and Matthew Breitrick on June 16,2023, Meemir Insurance is asking for reconsideration and a hearing to show that we made an attempt to send our
subrogation demand timely however we mistakenly sent it to the wrong department. A notice of claim form was completed on November 28, 2022 and sent via
mail fo Milwaukee County Clerk, 301 North Ninth St, Mihvankee, W1 53233,

We have to follow up on our chaims every thirty days until the claim is concluded. On December, 16, 2022, | resent our subrogation demand via email to Ryan
Anderson at r};a:x.anéersun@ charlestaylor.com. It wasn't wntil December 21, 2022 that ] received a response back indicating, “this would need to be directed to
the City of Milwaukee Clerk”. After returning from vacation, [ called the City Clerk’s office in February rand was given the appropriate istructions on how and
where 10 send sithrogation dentand notice by Tynelcka Shaw wha also sent to the instructons to me via email tn which | mailed out the demand.  You indicated you
received it in your office on Februar}' 7.2023,

Please reconsider at least recovery reimbursement to my insured, Teresa Breitrick and Matthew Breitrick, for their 3 500.00 out of pocket deductible for the
negligent act sustained by your emplayee by who collided into our insured’s vehidle.

Kind regards




Subrogativn Claim Representative 1R

Meemic Insurance Company

[T f,ipd\":\c it Aohurn Hilk, 3 4532
Offices sy 213770 et 31471

Fax: hadr 241370
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Mecwe pranuddy gives back to the sducativnal commmniy through The Meemee Founduion
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NOTICE OF CLAIM
AGAINST MILWAUKEE COUNTY

wame.  ANnette Williams/ Subrogation Claim Rep

Addross: 1080 N, Opdyké Rd, Auburn Hills, Ml 48326

Tetephone: 900 231 5770 ext 31473

Date ot Accident/T.oss: 08/ 24/ 2022

County Department Involved: Milwaukee Police Dept

.5,295.48

Dollar Amount Claimed:

Bricfly state the facts of the accident/loss (include additional pages if necessary along
with any supporting documentation/information; do not staple):

Report report # JOLOMJDNBE.

Two car accident. Both vehicles were W/B on W Fond Du Lac Ave stopped at a red
light. Police car was in the left iane, Meemic vehicle in the right lane, The light tumed
green and Meemic began to proceed thru the instersection just as the Police vehicle
tumed right from the left lane with emergency lights and siren and struck the side of
Meemiic vehicle. No injuries reported to Meemic.

Lis B

Meenmiic is seeking reimbursement of our collision payment § 3,895.48, rental payment
$900.00 and our insured's $500.00 deductible = $5,265.48.

Please issue payment fo Meemic Insurance, 1685 N. Opdyke Rd, Auburn Hills, MI
48326 and reference claim number 02006224

a, 2/17/ T 11/28/2022

Date;

Submit Claim to:  George L. Christenson, Milwaukee County Clerk
Milwaunkee County Courthouse, Room 105
901 North Ninth Streat
Milwaukee, W1 53233
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Annette M. Williams

Subjoct: B meemic ddaim 2 J2006224 ¢ tor hebdiiy subragation cleim sgainst milwaukes taty

From: Anrette M, Withams

Sent: Friday, Becember 23, 2022 1.5% PM

To: Byan Anderson <Rean Anderson@ohacestaylorconms

Subject: RE; memic clalm # D2065224 { tort Habidhy subrogatien tlaim against milwaukee enty

Eaen, v v sdea R SN TR PETE § T Oy R RS TIT
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satlaropation Ul i{ul.nz}-n,v.nt.ih:; il

From: Ryan Anderson <RyanAnderson@chzdestaylor.coms
Sent: Wednesday, December 21, 2022 13:56 &M
To: Annktte M. Willlams <amaetie Wiliaras@meenric coms

Subject: [EXTEANAL] Re: meemic claim # 02006224 / tor fiahility subrogation claim against silwasukee coty

s, Williams,

This would need to be directed to the City of Milwaukee Clerk. Milwaukee County is a different entity from the City of Milwaukee, Thank you.

Ryan Anderson | Field Claims Representative



Dirzer: 262 28% 149531 Rvan Andenon@chardcstavior.com

Regls, LT
A Chartes Taylor Company
P Yoo [nsure Your dobors

WAL TSSO O HON LO0

*FLEASE NOTE pAY NEW DIRECT PHONE NUMBER®

From: Annatte M, Williams <Annette WiliamsDmesm

Sent: Friday, December 16, 2027 8:37 A

To: Rpan Andarson <Ryan.dnderzon@chariestayios com>
Subjert: meermic iaim # 02006224 { tort Biabifity subrogation clain against milvaukes= ety

This amatt orlginated frem puiside the organizetion. Do not click Hinks or open sttachmeants unless you have varitled this email s {egitimate.
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FEARMAN SFENCER
City Attorrey

ODALG J. OHIKU

ROBIN A, PEDERSON

5.70DD FARRIS M
JENNIFER L WILLANS LY

Dzpy City Atiomeys

Hivankas City Hall Suite 800

June 6, 2023

Mis. Anneme Williams
Meamic Insurance Compaay
1683 North Opdyke Read
Auborn Hills, M1 4R326

200 East Wells Siren
Telephone. 414 2862608 - T80 414.2B&. 2025

HEIDT WICK SPOZRL
HATHRYN Z. BLOCK
THOMAS D. MELLER
PETER . BLOCK
PATRICK J. MCCLAIN
HANNAH R, JAHN

HRILIE P, WILSON
MEIGHAN M. ANGER
ALEXANDER H. CARBOR
ALEXANDER ¥, MUELLER
ALEXANDER 0. COSSY
Li5A A, GILMORE
TAVISS K. SMITH
KATHEHNE A. HEADLEY
L. ANTHORY JACKSGN

Miksat:hae, Wisconsi 53262-3551 STACY J. MILLER
Ea: 814 296.5550

MICHAEL £. RADAVICH
JORDAN M. SCHETTLE
THERESA A. MONTAG
ALEXANDER E. FOUNDGS
JAMES D, LEWIS
TRAVIS J. GRESHAM
KYLE W. BAILEY
JOSEPH Al DOBBS
WILLIAN K. HOTCHKISS
CLINT B. MIUCHE
hssigtant City Atornays

RE: Compstenication from MEEMIC INSURANCE CUNMPANY an hehalf of Teresa Breitrick
C. Fite No. HI32-2023-258
Your File: 2006224

Dear Mz, Williams:

We have received vonr claim in the amount of $5.293 48, in repards to property damage sustained from o
calliston that neeurred on Aoguse 24, 2022 focated at W. Capitof Drive and W, Fond Du Lac Avenue,

Fhis notice of claim was filed on February 7, 2023, Wisconsin Statute §893,80¢ Ld )} requires that a notice
of circumstances of the claim be served within 120 days after the happening of the event giving rise 10 the
claim. Because vau did not meet the statutory timefranee for service of netice, the file is being closed and
will not be processed further.

I you wish to appead this decision. yvour may do so by sending a written statement requesting a hearing
within 21 days of the pustarhed date of this letter 1o the Milwaukee City Clerk. 200 East Walls Streel
Room 205, Milwaohee, Wisconsin 33202, Please include a photocopy of this letter’s envelope, shawing

thie postosack. and retain the arigdast m the event farther prood is needad.

Very truly vours,

r\.‘
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FEARMANM SPENUCER

ity Aftornev

Tk oy
MICHELLE THOMPRON-GRAY
{nvestigator Adjoster
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TEARMAN SPENCER ‘
City Attorney ' .,}_1:,

ODALO J. OHIKU .
ROBIN A. PEDERSON CITY

5.TODD FARRIS M I LW - l( E

Deputy City Attorneys

HEIDI WICK SPOERL
KATHRYN Z. BLOCK
THOMAS D. MILLER
PETER J. BLOCK

. PATRICK J. MCCLAIN

HANNAH R. JAHN

JULIE P, WILSON
MEIGHAN M. ANGER
ALEXANDER R. CARSON
ALEXANDER T. MUELLER

" ALEXANDER D. COSSI

LISA A. GILMORE
TAVISS K. SMITH

JENNIFER L. WILLIAMS =
'O-Hl‘e*&-u‘t-t-he—a&l-t-yw&t-t-o'kn& = _ KATHERINE A, HEADLEY

L. ANTHONY JACKSON
STACY J. MILLER
MICHAEL C. RADAVICH
JORDAN M. SCHETTLE
THERESA A. MONTAG
ALEXANDER E. FOUNDOS
JAMES D. LEWIS
TRAVIS J. GRESHAM
KYLE W. BAILEY
JOSEPH M. DOBBS
WILLIAM K. HOTCHKISS
CLINT B. MUCHE

Assistant City Attorneys

Milwaukee City Hall Suite 800 » 200 East Wells Street » Milwaukee, Wisconsin 53202-3551
Telephone: 414,286.2601 - TDD: 414.286.2025 » Fax: 414.286.8550
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June 6, 2023

Ms. Annette Williams
Meemic Insurance Company
1685 North Opdyke Road
Auburn Hills, M1 48326

RE: Communication from MEEMIC INSURANCE COMPANY on behalf of Teresa Breitrick
C.I. File No. 1032-2023-258
Your File: 02006224

Dear Ms. Williams:.

We have received your claim in the amount of $5,295.48, in regards to property damage sustained from a
collision that occurred on August 24, 2022, located at W. Capitol Drive and W. Fond Du Lac Avenue.

This notice of claim was filed on February 7, 2023. Wisconsin Statute 893.80(1d)(a) requires that a notice
of circumstances of the claim be served within 120 days after the happening of the event giving rise to the
claim. Because you did not meet the statutory timeframe for service of notice, the file is being closed and
will not be processed further.

If you wish to appeal this decision, you may do so by sending a written statement requesting a hearing
within 21 days of the postmarked date of this letter to the Milwaukee City Clerk, 200 East Wells Street,
Room 205, Milwaukee, Wisconsin $3202. Please include a photocopy of this letter’s envelope, showing
the postmark, and retain the original in the event further proof is needed.

Very truly yours,

TEARMAN SPENCER
City Attorney
Llimuw-;ﬂfg;z;y M j :} /

MICHELLE THOMPSON-GR
Investigator Adjuster
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