## KENNETH J. MURRAY

Attorney at Law•
3153 North Knoll Terrace
Wauwatosa, Wisconsin 53222
(414) 475-6232

\*Also licensed to practice in Illinois

July 26, 2000

Mr. Ronald D. Leonhardt Milwaukee City Clerk 800 City Hall 200 East Wells Street Milwaukee, WI 53202 2/8/2001 0.K. JNS Lesser # 2295)

OO AUG -7 PN 1:
RONALD D. LEONHA.
CITY CLERKA

RE: Citizen Complaint of Ms. Kathryn Hanneman ω Against Police Officers Paul Bisswurm and Troy Miller

Complaint No.: 96-23

Date of Incident: March 5, 1996

Closed No.: 2008-K

Dear Mr. Leonhardt:

The above-named police officers have retained us to represent them in connection with the above-referenced matter.

Consistent with its policy, the City Attorney's Office has refused to represent them and as they were performing the duties of their office at the time of the events giving rise to the incident, the claim is hereby made on their behalf for the indicated legal fees. This incident involved a traffic stop. The Fire and Police Commission dismissed the complaint. Attached is a copy of the dismissal notice.

The following is an itemization of the time and services rendered.

DATE NATURE OF WORK PERFORMED

05-14-96 Open file; telephone call from client; mæmo 3.8 to file; correspondence to FPC Department ω of Transportation and Department of Justice Ν

NOTE PAUL BISSWURM & TROY MILLER ALE SEPERATED FROM SERVICE

| 05-20-96 | Conference with client  | 0.2  |
|----------|---|------|
| 05-22-96 | Review complaint, documents from Miller;                            | 0.8  |
|          | correspondence to FPC   |      |
| 05-29-96 | Review of correspondence from Department                            | 0.7  |
|          | of Justice; telephone call to client;                               |      |
|          | memo to file  |      |
| 05-31-96 | Review of correspondence from Department                            | 0.1  |
|          | of Justice  |      |
| 06-03-96 | Review of correspondence from FPC;                                  | 0.3  |
|          | telephone call to FPC; correspondence to                            |      |
|          | FPC   |      |
| 06-05-96 | Review of correspondence from FPC                                   | 0.1  |
| 07-16-96 | Telephone call from and to client; memo                             | 0.2  |
|          | to file   |      |
| 07-17-96 | Telephone calls to FPC; telephone call to                           | .0.7 |
|          | client; memo to file  |      |
| 07-23-96 | Review of correspondence from FPC;                                  | 0.2  |
|          | correspondence to client; telephone call                            |      |
|          | to FPC  |      |
| 09-19-96 | Preparation for and appearance at                                   | 1.2  |
|          | conciliation; conference with client; memo                          |      |
| •        | to file; travel   |      |
| 12-04-96 | Telephone call from Victoria; memo to file;                         | 0.3  |
|          | correspondence to clients   |      |
| 12-05-96 | Review of correspondence from FPC                                   | 0.1  |
| 12-16-96 | Telephone call to FPC; telephone call to                            | 0.9  |
|          | clients; conference with clients;                                   |      |
|          | preparation for and appearance at                                   |      |
|          | conciliation; travel; memo to file                                  |      |
|          |   |      |
| 770/1    |   |      |
| 110/hr   | Molombono moli form aliant talanta and                              |      |
| 01-06-97 | Telephone call from client; telephone call                          | 0.3  |
| 01 00 07 | to Victoria; memo to file   |      |
| 01-09-97 | Telephone call from client; telephone                               | 0.2  |
| 01-15-97 | call to FPC; memo to file   | A 10 |
| 01-15-97 | Telephone call to Victoria; memo to file;                           | 0.2  |
| 01 20 07 | correspondence to client  |      |
| 01-20-97 | Review of correspondence from FPC;                                  | 0.2  |
| 02-03-97 | correspondence to client  | ^ ^  |
| 02-03-97 | Review message from client; telephone                               | 0.2  |
| 02-05-97 | 1call to Victoria; memo to file                                     | 0 2  |
| 02-05-31 | Telephone call from Victoria;                                       | 0.3  |
| 02-06-97 | correspondence to client; memo to file Telephone call from Bisswurm | 0 1  |
| 02-06-97 |   | 0.1  |
| 02-10-97 | Review of correspondence from FPC                                   | 0.1  |

|          | telephone call to Victoria   |     |
|----------|--|-----|
| 04-07-97 | Telephone call to Victoria; correspondence to client; memo to file       | 0.2 |
| 05-21-97 | Telephone call to FPC; correspondence to client                          | 0.1 |
| 06-11-97 | Review of correspondence from FPC; correspondence to clients; close file | 0.5 |
|          | TOTAL HOURS  | 9.5 |

## **DISBURSEMENTS:**

| 12-16-96 Parking1.00 | 09-19-96 Parking<br>12-16-96 Parking | \$ 3.00<br>13.00<br>2.00<br>1.00 |
|----------------------|--------------------------------------|----------------------------------|
|----------------------|--------------------------------------|----------------------------------|

TOTAL \$ 19.00

6.6 hours at \$ 90.00 per hour = \$ 594.00 2.7 hours at \$110.00 per hour = \$ 297.00 Disbursements = 19.00

TOTAL DUE = \$ 910.00

Sincerely,

KENNETH J. MURRAY

Kenneth J./Murray

Attorney at Law

LAE/1dl BISSWURM

| BOARD OF FIRE AND POLICE COMMISSIONERS: CITY OF  | OF MILWAUKEE : COUNTY OF MILWAUKEE |
|--|------------------------------------|
|  |                                    |
| In Re:<br>THE CHARGES OF KATHRYN HANNEMANN<br>AGAINST POLICE OFFICERS PAUL<br>BISSWURM AND TROY MILLER |                                    |
|  | ORDER OF DISMISSAL                 |

To Officer Paul Bisswurm:

It is hereby ordered that the Complaint of Kathryn Hannemann, Complaint No. 96-23, filed with the Board on April 11, 1996, is dismissed due to Complainant's passivity, by the

MILWAUKEE BOARD OF FIRE AND POLICE COMMISSIONERS

PHOEBE WEAVER WILLIAMS, CHAIRMAN

BY:

JOSEPH J. CZARNEZKI EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR

DATED AT MILWAUKEE, WISCONSIN, JUNE 9, 1997.

cc: Attorney Laurie Eggert /

| BOARD OF<br>FIRE AND POLICE COMMISSIONERS: CITY   | OF MILWAUKEE: COUNTY OF MILWAUKEE                   |
|---|---|
| In Re: THE CHARGES OF KATHRYN HANNEMANN AGAINST POLICE OFFICERS PAUL BISSWURM AND TROY MILLER |   |
|   | ORDER OF DISMISSAL                                  |
| To Officer Troy Miller:   |   |
| It is hereby ordered that the Complaint of K  | athryn Hannemann, Complaint No. 96-23, filed with   |
| the Board on April 11, 1996, is dismissed due to Co   | omplainant's passivity, by the                      |
|   | MILWAUKEE BOARD OF<br>FIRE AND POLICE COMMISSIONERS |
|   | PHOERE WEAVED WILLIAMS                              |

JOSEPH J. CZARNEZKI EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR

**CHAIRMAN** 

BY:

DATED AT MILWAUKEE, WISCONSIN, JUNE 9, 1997.

cc: Attorney Laurie Eggert