To The Administrative Review Board of Appeals:
My Contractor and | reviewed the photos/documents re: 321 & 317 E Burleigh St. Milw.

My Contractor's Perspectives

My contractor wanted me to share that the order from the City of Milwaukee inspector was to
repair the porch, not to replace it. He said he separated the debris from the wood that he was
going to re-use to repair the porch. He had already disposed of the debris and left the good
woods to re-use because the order was to repair the porch, not to replace it. Apparently, the City
Contractor came and removed the woods.

My Contractor also said the wood that was inside the propertyfyard should not have been
removed. He feels it's like someone trespassing into another person's property. He said the city
had already issued an order to repair the porch and gave a time line to complete the work. The
order had not expired by the time the wood was removed.

My Contractor said he talked to the inspector and he told him that the fine was for a clean up
order. He reasoned that if it were a clean up order, why were some few black bags still left at the
property as shown in the pictures.

Lastly my Contractor said he was updating the City inspector Mr. Tim all along. He told him he
was waiting to pull permit as he ordered and the cold weather had not allowed him to start work
or do anything

From the Owner Ms. Obiora’s Perspectives

| am requesting the fine of $1076.63 be rescinded. There was a police chase, and the person
they were chasing ran into my property, causing the damage to the porch. The whole porch of
approx. 10 X 15 ft size was damaged/collapsed. The porch will cost a few thousands to replace
and to be specific $4,500.00 | should be compensated for the damage. | am not able fo pay the
cost of replacing the porch and the fine.

Another point | want to make is that the City normally does not come out to write orders while
the temperatures are at zero or below. | will expect an extension until the weather is conducive
for outdoor repairs.

There was a notice letter written on 1/10/25 that was sent by the dept of Neighborhood services,
notifying me of the clean up order. | was out of the Country from Dec 29th-Jan 20st 2025. | saw

the letter on Jan 21st upon my return. | attached my flight itinerary to prove that.

Please | am requesting that the fine be rescinded.
Thank you.

Ms. Ngozi Obiora



Fwd: eTicket Itinerary and Receipt for Confirmation O459YH

From: Kenechi Obiora {obiorakenny@gmail.com)
To.  eobiora@aol.com
Date: Monday, March 10, 2025 at 04:02 PM CDT

---------- Forwarded message -------—

From: United Airlines <Receipts@united.com>

Date: Sat, Sep 21, 2024 at 2:00 PM

Subject: eTicket itinerary and Receipt for Confirmation O439YH
To: <OBIQORAKENNY @gmail.com>

UNITED 53]
Thank you for choosing United.

Sat, Sep 21, 2024

A receipt of your purchase is shown below. Please retain this email receipt for your records.

Get ready for your trip: Visit the Travel-Ready Center, your one-stop digital assistant, to find out

about important travel requirements specific to your trip.

Confirmation Number:

O4S9YH

Flight 1 of 4 UA8837

Sun, Dec 29, 2024

03:55 PM

Chicago, IL, US (ORD)

Flight Operated by Lufthansa.

If this is an ariginating flight on your itinerary, please check in at the LUFTHANSA ticket counter.

Flight 2 of 4 UAS002

Mon, Dec 30, 20624

11:10 AM

Frankfurt, DE (FRA)

Class: Economy (W)

Mon, Dec 30, 2024

07:25 AM
Frankfurt, DE (FRA)

Class: Economy (W)

Men, Dec 30, 2024

05:20 PM

Abuja, NG (ABV)



Flight Operated by Lufthansa.

If this is an ariginating flight on your itinerary, please check in at the LUFTHANSA ticket counter.

Flight 3 of 4 UAS021

Sat, Jan 18, 2025

11:05 PM

Abuja, NG (ABV)

Flight Operated by Lufthansa.

If this Is an originating flight on your itinerary, please check in at the LUFTHANSA ticket counter.

Flight 4 of 4 LH430

Sun, Jan 18, 2025

10:50 AM

Frankfurt, DE (FRA)
Flight Operated by Lufthansa.

Traveler Details

OBIORA/NGOZI
eTicket number: 0162422492956

Purchase Summary

Method of payment:
Date of purchase

Alrfare
U.S. Transportation Tax:
Germany Passenger Service Charge:
Germany Airport Security Charge:

Passenger Civil Aviation Security Service Fee:

International Surcharge:
U.S. APHIS User Fee:
U.S. Customs User Fee:

Class: Economy (W)

Sun, Jan 19, 2025

05:25 AM

Frankfurt, DE (FRA)

Class: Economy (Y)

Sun, Jan 19, 2025

01:25 PM

Chicago, L, US (ORD)

Seats: ORD-FRA «a=--

Miscellaneous Document
Sat, Sep 21, 2024

672. 00
44.40
54.80
21.40

5.60
610.00
3.83
6.97



