2/9/2001

KENNETH J. MURRAY

Attorney at Law3153 North Knoll Terrace
Wauwatosa, Wisconsin 53222
(414) 475-6232

2 Claims
a Hacked >

*Also licensed to practice in Illinois

July 26, 2000

Mr. Ronald D. Leonhardt Milwaukee City Clerk 800 City Hall 200 East Wells Street Milwaukee, WI 53202 Clum#27
0. K.
5785
Letter # (2295)

BONALD D. LEONHA RONALD D. LEONHA RONALD D. LEONHA

RE: Citizen Complaint of Ms. Wanda I. Santiago Against Police Officers Neil Saxton and Michael Lutz

Complaint No.: 96-41

Date of Incident: June 20, 1996

Closed No.: 2016-K

Dear Mr. Leonhardt:

The above-named police officers have retained us to represent them in connection with the above-referenced matter. The officers were also represented by another law firm (Eggert Law Office, S.C.) which has submitted a separate bill to you regarding this matter.

Consistent with its policy, the City Attorney's Office has refused to represent them and as they were performing the duties of their office at the time of the events giving rise to the incident, the claim is hereby made on their behalf for the indicated legal fees. This incident involved a juvenile arrest at a district station. The Fire and Police Commission dismissed the complaint. Attached is a copy of the dismissal notice.

The following is an itemization of the time and services rendered.

DATE	NATURE OF WORK PERFORMED	H © URS <u>□</u>
09-23-96	Open file; conference with client; memo to	\$.¥€
	file; correspondence to FPC	d 80
10-07-96	Review of correspondence from FPC;	0.8
	conference with clients; memo to file;	3 52
	preparation for and appearance at -<	့ယ္က 🚆
-		2 n ·

conciliation

110/hr		
02-10-97	Review of correspondence from FPC	0.1
02-11-97	Review of file	0.3
02-13-97	Telephone call from Victoria	0.1
02-18-97	Telephone call to victoria	0.1
02-19-97	Preparation for and appearance at	1.2
	conciliation; conference with client; memo	
	to file; travel	
03-20-97	Review message from Victoria	0.1
03-21-97	Telephone call to Victoria	0.1
03-28-97	Review of correspondence from FPC	0.1
04-09-97	Telephone call from and to Lutz; telephone	0.3
	call to FPC; memo to file	
05-22-97	Review of correspondence from FPC	0.1
05-28-97	Preparation for and appearance at	0.7
	conciliation; conference with clients;	
	memo to file; travel	
	TOTAL HOURS	4.4

DISBURSEMENTS:

10-07-96	Parking			\$ 0.50
02-19-97	Parking			1.00
05-28-97	Parking			1.00
		•	moma r	4 0 .50
			TOTAL	\$ 2.50

1.2 hours at \$ 90.00 per hour = \$ 108.00 3.2 hours at \$110.00 per hour = \$ 352.00 Disbursements = 2.50

TOTAL DUE = \$ 462.50

Sincerely,

KENNETH J. MURRAY

Kenneth J./Murray

Attorney at Law

LAE/ldl SAXTON41



BOARD OF
FIRE AND POLICE COMMISSIONERS: CITY OF MILWAUKEE: COUNTY OF MÎLWAUKEE

In Re:
THE CHARGES OF WANDA I. SANTIAGO
AGAINST POLICE OFFICER NEIL SAXTON
AND MICHAEL LUTZ

ORDER OF DISMISSAL

To Officer Neil Saxton:

It is hereby ordered that the Complaint of Wanda I. Santiago, Complaint No. 96-41, filed with the Board on July 1, 1996, is dismissed due to Complainant's passivity, by the

MILWAUKEE BOARD OF FIRE AND POLICE COMMISSIONERS

AUGUST G. ERDMANN, CHAIRMAN

BY:

JOSEPH J. CZARNEZKI EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR

DATED AT MILWAUKEE, WISCONSIN, OCTOBER 16, 1997.

cc: Attorney Laurie Eggert

OCT 20 1997

BOARD OF FIRE AND POLICE COMMISSIONERS: CITY OF M	MI WALIFE . COLINT	V OE MILWANDE	
	MILWAUREE : COUNT	T OF MILWAUKEE	
In Re: THE CHARGES OF WANDA I. SANTIAGO AGAINST POLICE OFFICER NEIL SAXTON AND MICHAEL LUTZ			
	ORDER OF	ORDER OF DISMISSAL	
To Officer Michael Lutz:		•	

It is hereby ordered that the Complaint of Wanda I. Santiago, Complaint No. 96-41, filed with the Board on July 1, 1996, is dismissed due to Complainant's passivity, by the

MILWAUKEE BOARD OF FIRE AND POLICE COMMISSIONERS

AUGUST G. ERDMANN, CHAIRMAN

BY:

JOSEPH J. CZARNEZKI EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR

DATED AT MILWAUKEE, WISCONSIN, OCTOBER 16, 1997.

cc: Attorney Laurie Eggert ~