

CERMELE & ASSOCIATES, S.C.

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

JONATHAN CERMELE
LAURIE A. EGGERT
RACHEL L. PINCS
MATTHEW L. GRANITZ

6310 WEST BLUEMOUND ROAD
SUITE 200
MILWAUKEE, WISCONSIN 53213
(414) 276-8750
FAX (414) 276-8906

October 3, 2006

Mr. Jan Smokowicz
Milwaukee City Attorneys Office
200 East Wells Street, #800
Milwaukee, WI 53202

**RE: Citizen Complaint of Mr. Karl A. Edwards
Against Police Officers Kenneth Harris, Jr. and Mitchell Ward
FPC No.: 02-50
Date of Incident: August 5, 2002
Location of Incident: 3626 North 40th Street**

Dear Mr. Smokowicz

I am submitting the amended claim for the above-referenced matter. All reference and time associated with Police Officer Bartlett has been removed. This includes:

1. .70 hours on 05/15/2003;
2. .60 hours on 05/20/2003; and,
3. .60 hours on 05/28/2003.

Thank you.

Sincerely,

CERMELE & ASSOCIATES, S.C.

Jon Cermele

JC/kjs
Enclosure

10/18/06

O.K.

JAS

CI File 04-5-98
Use Docs open # 109869
as form for letter

CERMELE & ASSOCIATES, S.C.
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

JONATHAN CERMELE
LAURIE A. EGGERT
RACHELL PINGS
MATTHEW L. GRANITZ

6310 WEST BLUEMOUND ROAD
SUITE 200
MILWAUKEE, WISCONSIN 53213
(414) 276-8750
FAX (414) 276-8906

October 03, 2006

Mr. Ronald Leonhardt
 Milwaukee City Clerk
 City Hall
 200 East Wells Street
 Milwaukee WI 53202

RE: Citizen Complaint of Mr. Karl A. Edwards
 Against PO's Kenneth Harris, Jr. and Mitchell Ward
 FPC No: 02-50
 Date of Incident: August 5, 2002
 Location of Incident: 3626 North 40th Street
 Professional services

	<u>Hours</u>
10/17/2002 Conference with client; memo to file; correspondence to FPC; open file.	0.80
10/28/2002 Review of file.	0.20
10/31/2002 Telephone call from client; telephone call to FPC; review of file; telephone call to client; memo to file; telephone call from client.	0.80
11/5/2002 Review of correspondence from FPC.	0.10
11/7/2002 Update records regarding complainant's criminal case; memo to file.	0.60
11/8/2002 Telephone call to Mitch Ward; review documents from Ward; memo to file; correspondence to FPC.	1.30
1/22/2003 Review of file; update computer search regarding complainant's criminal case; memo to file.	0.50
4/4/2003 Telephone call from FPC; review of file; memo to file.	0.40
4/5/2003 Review documents from MPD Open Records; computer search regarding open cases.	0.60
7/30/2003 Review of file; review of correspondence from FPC.	0.20

Mr. Ronald Leonhardt

Page 2
Hours

7/31/2003	Review of file; computer update of criminal case against complainant.	0.40
8/27/2003	Review status of criminal case.	0.10
10/17/2003	Computer update of criminal and municipal court proceedings regarding incident; memo to file; review of file.	0.70
10/28/2003	Review of file; memo to file.	0.10
11/5/2003	Computer update on criminal charge regarding same incident; correspondence to court clerk; review of file; memo to file.	0.60
11/11/2003	Review Fax from Circuit Court clerk; correspondence to clerk.	0.20
11/17/2003	Review of file; memo to file.	0.20
11/25/2003	Telephone call from FPC.	0.10
12/1/2003	Review of file; telephone call to and from FPC.	0.30
12/2/2003	Review documents from Circuit Court.	0.20
12/3/2003	Telephone call from FPC; review of file; memo to file.	0.30
12/17/2003	Review of correspondence from FPC; correspondence to clients; memo to file.	0.30
1/20/2004	Telephone call from FPC; review of file; memo to file.	0.20
1/23/2004	Preparation for and appearance at conciliation; conference with clients; memo to file; travel.	1.40
2/13/2004	Review of file; memo to file; correspondence to client.	0.30
2/18/2004	Telephone call from and to client; review of file; memo to file; review dismissal notice; correspondence to client; close file.	0.70

	<u>Amount</u>
For professional services rendered	11.60 \$1,276.00

Mr. Ronald Leonhardt

Page 3

Costs:

	<u>Amount</u>
4/5/2003 MPD Open Records request	18.23
1/23/2004 Parking	3.00
 Total costs	 \$21.23
 Total amount of this bill	 \$1,297.23
 Balance due	 \$1,297.23

(Rate: \$110.00 per hour)

CERMELE & ASSOCIATES, S.C.
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

JONATHAN CERMELE
LAURIE A. EGGERT
RACHEL L. PINGS
MATTHEW L. GRANITZ

6310 WEST BLUEMOUND ROAD
SUITE 200
MILWAUKEE, WISCONSIN 53213
(414) 276-8750
FAX (414) 276-8906

DATE:

10/03/06

TO:

MR. Jan Smokowicz

FAX NO.:

286-8550

RE:

Revised bill

FROM:

Jon Cermel

Originals Mailed: YES NO

NUMBER OF PAGES INCLUDING COVER: 5

MESSAGE:

Please see attached.

**IF YOU HAVE ANY TROUBLE WITH THIS TRANSMISSION,
PLEASE CALL (414) 276-8750.**

The information contained in this facsimile message is intended only for the personal and confidential use of the designated recipient or any agent responsible for delivering it to the intended recipient. You are hereby notified that if you have received this document in error, please be aware that any review, disclosure, copying distribution or use of the contents of this message is strictly prohibited. If you receive this communication in error, please immediately notify us by telephone at the above number. Thank you.

EGGERT & CERMELE, S.C.

Attorneys at Law

Laurie A. Eggert
Jonathan Cermele
Rachel L. Schneider

1840 North Farwell Avenue
Suite 303
Milwaukee, Wisconsin 53202
(414) 276-8750
FAX (414) 276-8906

March 23, 2004

Mr. Ronald D. Leonhardt
Milwaukee City Clerk
800 City Hall
200 East Wells Street
Milwaukee, WI 53202

**RE: Citizen Complaint of Mr. Karl A. Edwards
Against POs Kenneth Harris, Jr., Mitchell Ward and Jon Bartlett
Complaint No.: 02-50
Date of Incident: August 5, 2002
EC No.: 2004**

Dear Mr. Leonhardt:

The above-named police officers have retained us to represent them in connection with the above-referenced matter.

Consistent with its policy, the City Attorney's Office has refused to represent them and as they were performing the duties of their office at the time of the events giving rise to the incident, the claim is hereby made on their behalf for the indicated legal fees. This incident involved a call for backup regarding a subject with a gun. The Fire and Police Commission dismissed the complaint. Attached is a copy of the dismissal notice and an itemization of the time and services rendered.

Sincerely,

EGGERT & CERMELE, S.C.

Laurie A. Eggert
Attorney at Law

LAE/ldl
attachment
HARWARBAR

RECEIVED

FEB 18 2004

EGGERT & CERMELE, S.C.

BOARD OF
FIRE AND POLICE COMMISSIONERS : CITY OF MILWAUKEE : COUNTY OF MILWAUKEE

In Re:
THE CHARGES OF KARL EDWARDS
AGAINST POLICE OFFICERS MITCHELL WARD, JON BARTLETT AND
POLICE SERGEANTS IVORY BRITTON JR. AND KENNETH HARRIS JR.

ORDER OF DISMISSAL

To Sergeant Kenneth Harris Jr.:

It is hereby ordered that the Complaint of Karl Edwards, Complaint No. 02-50, filed with the Board on August 27, 2002, is dismissed due to the Complainant's passivity, by the

MILWAUKEE BOARD OF
FIRE AND POLICE COMMISSIONERS

ERIC MANDEL JOHNSON,
CHAIRMAN

BY:



DAVID L. HEARD
EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR

DATED AT MILWAUKEE, WISCONSIN, FEBRUARY 11, 2004.

 c: Attorney Laurie Eggert

RECEIVED

FEB 1 2004

EGGERT & CERMELE, S.C.

BOARD OF
FIRE AND POLICE COMMISSIONERS : CITY OF MILWAUKEE : COUNTY OF MILWAUKEE

In Re:
THE CHARGES OF KARL EDWARDS
AGAINST POLICE OFFICERS MITCHELL WARD, JON BARTLETT AND
POLICE SERGEANTS IVORY BRITTON JR. AND KENNETH HARRIS JR.

ORDER OF DISMISSAL

To Officer Mitchell Ward:

It is hereby ordered that the Complaint of Karl Edwards, Complaint No. 02-50, filed with the Board on August 27, 2002, is dismissed due to the Complainant's passivity, by the

MILWAUKEE BOARD OF
FIRE AND POLICE COMMISSIONERS

ERIC MANDEL JOHNSON,
CHAIRMAN

BY:



DAVID L. HEARD
EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR

DATED AT MILWAUKEE, WISCONSIN, FEBRUARY 11, 2004.

Jc: Attorney Laurie Eggert

RECEIVED

FFB 1 & 2004

EGGERT & CERMELE, S.C.

BOARD OF
FIRE AND POLICE COMMISSIONERS : CITY OF MILWAUKEE : COUNTY OF MILWAUKEE

In Re:
THE CHARGES OF KARL EDWARDS
AGAINST POLICE OFFICERS MITCHELL WARD, JON BARTLETT AND
POLICE SERGEANTS IVORY BRITTON JR. AND KENNETH HARRIS JR.

ORDER OF DISMISSAL

To Officer Jon Bartlett:

It is hereby ordered that the Complaint of Karl Edwards, Complaint No. 02-50, filed with the Board on August 27, 2002, is dismissed due to the Complainant's passivity, by the

MILWAUKEE BOARD OF
FIRE AND POLICE COMMISSIONERS

ERIC MANDEL JOHNSON,
CHAIRMAN

BY:



DAVID L. HEARD
EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR

DATED AT MILWAUKEE, WISCONSIN, FEBRUARY 11, 2004.

/c: Attorney Laurie Eggert

EGGERT & CERMELE, S.C.

Attorneys at Law

Laurie A. Eggert
Jonathan Cermele
Rachel L. Schneider

1840 North Farwell Avenue
Suite 303
Milwaukee, Wisconsin 53202
(414) 276-8750
FAX (414) 276-8906

March 23, 2004

Mr. Ronald Leonhardt
Milwaukee City Clerk
City Hall
200 East Wells Street
Milwaukee WI 53202

RE: Citizen Complaint of Mr. Karl A. Edwards
Against POs Kenneth Harris, Jr., Mitchell Ward and Jon Bartlett
FPC No: 02-50
Date of Incident: August 5, 2002
Location of Incident: 3626 North 40th Street
Professional services

	<u>Hours</u>
10/17/2002 Conference with client; memo to file; correspondence to FPC; open file.	0.80
10/28/2002 Review of file.	0.20
10/31/2002 Telephone call from client; telephone call to FPC; review of file; telephone call to client; memo to file; telephone call from client.	0.80
11/5/2002 Review of correspondence from FPC.	0.10
11/7/2002 Update records regarding complainant's criminal case; memo to file.	0.60
11/8/2002 Telephone call to Mitch Ward; review documents from Ward; memo to file; correspondence to FPC.	1.30
1/22/2003 Review of file; update computer search regarding complainant's criminal case; memo to file.	0.50
4/4/2003 Telephone call from FPC; review of file; memo to file.	0.40
4/5/2003 Review documents from MPD Open Records; computer search regarding open cases.	0.60

	<u>Hours</u>
5/15/2003 Office conference with Bartlett; memo to file.	0.70
5/20/2003 Review documents from Bartlett; correspondence to FPC; telephone call to client.	0.60
5/28/2003 Telephone call to and from Bartlett; memo to file.	0.60
7/30/2003 Review of file; review of correspondence from FPC.	0.20
7/31/2003 Review of file; computer update of criminal case against complainant.	0.40
8/27/2003 Review status of criminal case.	0.10
10/17/2003 Computer update of criminal and municipal court proceedings regarding incident; memo to file; review of file.	0.70
10/28/2003 Review of file; memo to file.	0.10
11/5/2003 Computer update on criminal charge regarding same incident; correspondence to court clerk; review of file; memo to file.	0.60
11/11/2003 Review Fax from Circuit Court clerk; correspondence to clerk.	0.20
11/17/2003 Review of file; memo to file.	0.20
11/25/2003 Telephone call from FPC.	0.10
12/1/2003 Review of file; telephone call to and from FPC.	0.30
12/2/2003 Review documents from Circuit Court.	0.20
12/3/2003 Telephone call from FPC; review of file; memo to file.	0.30
12/17/2003 Review of correspondence from FPC; correspondence to clients; memo to file.	0.30

	<u>Hours</u>
1/20/2004 Telephone call from FPC; review of file; memo to file.	0.20
1/23/2004 Preparation for and appearance at conciliation; conference with clients; memo to file; travel.	1.40
2/13/2004 Review of file; memo to file; correspondence to client.	0.30
2/18/2004 Telephone call from and to client; review of file; memo to file; review dismissal notice; correspondence to client; close file.	0.70
	<u>Amount</u>
For professional services rendered	13.50
Additional charges:	\$1,485.00
4/5/2003 MPD Open Records request	18.23
1/23/2004 Parking	3.00
 Total costs	 \$21.23
Total amount of this bill	\$1,506.23
 Balance due	 \$1,506.23

(Rate: \$110.00 per hour)

MILWAUKEE POLICE DEPARTMENT

MEMORANDUM

APRIL 12, 2004

TO: SGT. KENNETH HARRIS
DISTRICT: OFFICE OF THE CHIEF

RE: Receipt of Legal Services from Law Firm of
Attorney

Attorney Laurie Eggert has made a claim with the City, indicating the attached was provided with legal services arising out of one of the following situations:

- 1) An incident occurring on AUGUST 5, 2002
- 2) A citizen's complaint made by KARL EDWARDS
- 3) A police shooting incident occurring on N/A

Is this information correct? YES NO _____

Did you receive legal representation
in this matter? YES NO _____

Your signature: Kenneth Harris

Print your name: Kenneth Harris

Upon completion, please return this memorandum to the Internal Affairs Division at the Police Academy (Room 325) as soon as possible.



Steven M. Settingsgaard
INSPECTOR OF POLICE
Internal Affairs Division

SMS:kjs

MILWAUKEE POLICE DEPARTMENT

MEMORANDUM

APRIL 12, 2004

TO: P.O. MITCHELL WARD
DISTRICT: VCD

RE: Receipt of Legal Services from Law Firm of
Attorney

Attorney Laurie Eggert has made a claim with the City, indicating the attached was provided with legal services arising out of one of the following situations:

- 1) An incident occurring on AUGUST 5, 2002
- 2) A citizen's complaint made by KARL EDWARDS
- 3) A police shooting incident occurring on N/A

Is this information correct?

YES NO _____

Did you receive legal representation
in this matter?

YES NO _____

Your signature: Mitchell G. Ward

Print your name: MITCHELL G. WARD

Upon completion, please return this memorandum to the Internal Affairs Division at the Police Academy (Room 325) as soon as possible.

SP-2004-1
0410 APR 29 2004
SMS: KJS


Steven M. Settingsgaard
INSPECTOR OF POLICE
Internal Affairs Division

MILWAUKEE POLICE DEPARTMENT

MEMORANDUM

APRIL 12, 2004

TO: P.O. JON BARTLETT
DISTRICT: SEVEN

RE: Receipt of Legal Services from Law Firm of
Attorney

Attorney Laurie Eggert has made a claim with the City, indicating the attached was provided with legal services arising out of one of the following situations:

- 1) An incident occurring on AUGUST 5, 2002
- 2) A citizen's complaint made by KARL EDWARDS
- 3) A police shooting incident occurring on N/A

Is this information correct? YES NO

Did you receive legal representation in this matter? YES NO

Your signature: 

Print your name: Jon BARTLETT

Upon completion, please return this memorandum to the Internal Affairs Division at the Police Academy (Room 325) as soon as possible.


Steven M. Settingsgaard
INSPECTOR OF POLICE
Internal Affairs Division

SMS:kjs