Matteo Sollena T, U,
9639 Clayton Ave. '
Neenah, WI 54956 o P o 7
920-970-8000 AR
sollena@att.net

November 26, 2024
To whom it may concern,

I would like to file a claim against the City of Milwaukee for damages, in the amount of $16,881,
to my property at 7324 W. Capitol Dr. These damages were caused by the city installing a light
pole. From my understanding, the drilling for the city light moved a big rock, which damaged the
pipes that go to my property. Since the pole has been installed, there have been issues with the
sewer line towards the main hall.

January 24th, 2024 Plugged Pipes LLC was hired to assess the damages with a scope. The
cost of the estimate was $1006.05. We were unsatisfied with Plugged Pipes, LLC, and with it
being winter we decided to wait to get a second opinion in Spring from Pipes Inspector LLC to
locate where the issues stemmed from. | paid $875 for this estimate. August 29th, 2024 Badger
Undgerground Inc completed the work which cost $15,000. The estimates and invoices are
enclosed. Photos of when Badger Underground was completing the work are also enclosed.
You can see the rock and the damage that was caused.

Please contact me if you have any questions.
Thank you,

Matteo Sollena
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All matenal is guaranteel to be as specified, and the above work to be performed in accordance with the drawirigs and specifications

submitied for above work and completed in a substantial workmalike manner for the sum R~
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Respectfully Submitted W
Any alteration or deviation from above specifications involving extra costs P
ﬂmmmwwmm.mmmmemmm N is proposal may be withdrawn by us
over and above the estimate. All agreements contingent upon strikes, if not accepted within __ € days.

accidents, or delays beyond our control.

Acceptance Of Proposal

The above prices, specifications and conditions are satisfactory and are hereby accepted. You are authorized to do the work as specified.
Payments will be made as outlined above.

Signature:

Signature: Date:
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Lynndale Licia <lynndale@coldwellhomes.com>

Fwd: Receipt Confirmation
1 message

Matteo Sollena <sollena@att.net>
To: lasplund@coldwellhomes.com

Sent from Matteo Sollena

Begin forwarded message:

Wed, Feb 28, 2024 at 9:14 AM

From: do_not_reply <do_not_reply@payments.intuit.com>
Date: January 24, 2024 at 10:50:39 AM CST

To: sollena@att.net

Subject: Receipt Confirmation
Reply-To: mike@pluggedpipes.com

Plugged Pipes LLC

PO Box 321425, Franklin, Wi 53132
(414)588-9110

INVOICE #18123

Receipt
VISA 8149 2024-01-24
Entry method : Keyed 08:50 AM

$1,006.05

Invoice #18123
Amount $1,006.05

Paid $1,006.05
Due 2024-01-24

Total $1,006.05

No additional transfer fees or taxes apply.

Card Transaction Details:

VISA 8149

Card Holder Name: MATTTEO SOLLENA
Entry Method: Keyed




% 4@5@5
ﬁﬁjjh/ WZ@%

ﬂ/ﬁ%ﬁm WELS/<T | #;5}0

,‘( WORK PERFORMED AT:

" MatteoS ollea | 720 (. &/M%{m

Contractors Invoice

f DATE R voun WORK ORDER NO.

et lttes )

%

DESCRIPTION OF WORK PERFORMED
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All Material is guaénteed tobeas specmed and the above work was peﬂorm@d ina

ccordance with the drawings and specificatiogs provided for the above
work and was completed in a §ubstant|al workmanlike manner for the agreed sum of MM
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This is a [_]Parti ull invoice due and payable by: /7 Z‘ _

in accordance with our DAgreement [JProposal
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